Procurement Contracts Officer:
Brenda Sensibaugh

6717 OF REBID

NDOT

COMMODITY NAME

Interstate Highway Sign Corp

Vulcan Inc.DBA Vulcan Signs

UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
LINE # DESCRIPTION Qry uom llleIIDiI‘EY PRICE lllell;fY 3€I;I:||(§ILEJR
36 HOUR RUSH
DELIVERY DELIVERY RUSH
FLAT SHEET SIGNS
1|Flat Sheet Sign- Type IV Sheeting 45,000| SQ.FT. | S 9.011|$ 12.38 | S 7.90 | S 11.28
Flat Sheet Sign- Type IX or Xl
2 |Fluorescent Sheeting 33,000 SQ.FT. | § 1032 (S 13.97 | S 10.35 | S 14.80
Flat Sheet Sign- Fluorescent
3|Orange Sheeting 17,000| SQ.FT. | S 10.45 | $ 1413 | S 10.35 | S 14.80
4[Flat Sheet Sign- Type Xl Sheeting 500| SQ.FT. | S 1045 (S 14.13 | S 10.96 | S 15.65
5|Hinged Sign- Type IV Sheeting 360| SQ.FT. [ § 22.71|5S 33.34 | S 1434 | S 20.48
Hinged Sign- Type IX or XI
6|Fluorescent Sheeting 360 SQ.FT. | § 24.03|S 3493 | S 1737 | S 21.71
EXTRUDED ALUMINUM SIGNS
7|Extruded Aluminum Sign- Type IV Sheeting 2500| SQ.FT. | S 1938 (S 28.92 [ NOBID NO BID
Extruded Aluminum Sign SQFT. | 2091
8|Fluorescent Orange Sheeting 500 C ' S 30.78 [ NOBID NO BID
9|Extruded Aluminum Sign- Type XI Sheeting 500| SQ.FT. | S 21.35(S 31.31 | NOBID NO BID
MISC
10|Sheeting 500] SQ.FT. NO BID NO BID
11|Plastic 150| SQ.FT. NO BID NO BID
TOTAL:
PAYMENT TERMS: 0%, 0 DAYS
DELIVERY DAYS ARO: 30 DAYS
COMMENTS:

10F1

OPENING DATE: January 19, 2023



